Beth st WoodstockVT Chamber

L ]

From: Phil Warren <pwarren4ducks@comcast.net>
Sent: Tuesday, December 13, 2022 1:06 PM

To: Beth at WoodstockVT Chamber

Subject: Re: Wassail

Yes and yes.

| will mark our calendar!!
Philip Warren

> 0n Dec 13, 2022, at 10:05 AM, Beth at WoodstockVT Chamber <bfinIayson@woodstockvt.com> wrote:
>

> Thank you and Janet so much! Great fun for everyone. SO to be clear- we owe you $2550?

> Will get a check out on Friday!

>

> Can we book you for Dec 8-9-10, 2023?

> Merry Christmas!

>\]Beth

> From: Phil Warren <pwarren4ducks@comcast.net>

> Sent: Tuesday, December 13, 2022 9:09 AM

> To: Elizabeth Finlayson Chamber <bfinlayson@woodstockvt.com>

> Subject: Wassail

>

> Our mailing address is

> Phil and Janet Warren

> PO Box 488

> Alstead NH 03602

> Check payable to the Warren Farm

> Last year you paid $850 per day. Despite increased costs for fuel, insurance, shoeing and grain at $850 we are happy.
> Glad to have participated in a successful weekend. Kudos to you and the Chamber!!

Woodstock Area Chamber of Commerce | -
Warren Farm 12/12/2022 004681
Date Type Reference Original Amt. Balance Due Discount Pa t
12/1 3/2;?22 Bill  Wassail 2022 2,550.00 2,550.00 2 5):5%6(;10
j/ Check Amount 2,550.00
PUB Checking - 9420 Horse & Buggy Rides ' 2,5650.00
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